

Harry v. McCrory  
Appendix A

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Rate	Subtotal	Description of Work
3/7/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	3.50	655.00	2,292.50	Review briefing filed regarding remedial map (1.8); conference with A. Khanna regarding related briefing (1.2); exchange related email (.5);
3/7/2016	Khanna, Abha	5.10	525.00	2,677.50	Review response and associated exhibits in preparation for reply brief (2.2); review comments/reactions via email from K. Hamilton and B. Stafford (0.3); draft outline for reply brief (1.1); begin drafting reply brief (1.5)
3/7/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.20	495.00	594.00	Review Defendants' response on remedial phase and provide A. Khanna with initial analysis of same;
3/8/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	2.50	655.00	1,637.50	Review briefing relating to remedial map and outline for reply (1.2); conference with A. Khanna regarding same (.8); review and respond to related email (.5);
3/8/2016	Khanna, Abha	12.70	525.00	6,667.50	Research, draft and revise reply brief on remedy (12.4); confer with K. Hamilton regarding same (0.3);
3/8/2016	Spiva, Bruce V.	1.20	600.00	786.00	Review defendants' brief;
3/8/2016	Spiva, Bruce V.	0.50	600.00	327.50	Review emails from team regarding defendants' brief;
3/9/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	7.20	655.00	4,716.00	Review papers filed by state regarding remedial map (2.4); review and revise draft reply brief (3.9); conference with A. Khanna regarding same (.9);
3/9/2016	Khanna, Abha	7.60	525.00	3,990.00	Review and revise reply brief, incorporating legal team's edits and cutting down on page length along the way (6.9); confer with K. Hamilton regarding same (0.3); email and telephone conference with J. O'Hale regarding election statistics (0.4);
3/9/2016	Spiva, Bruce V.	1.70	600.00	1,113.50	Review and comment on reply brief;
3/9/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.70	495.00	841.50	Review and revise reply brief on remedy;
3/11/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.50	655.00	982.50	Review briefing on remedial maps (.5); follow up with B. Stafford regarding deadline for filing attorneys' fees petition (.5); exchange email regarding same (.5);
3/12/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.70	655.00	458.50	Exchange email with B. Stafford regarding attorneys' fee petition deadline and data collection;
3/16/2016	Stafford, William B.	3.10	495.00	1,534.50	Draft fee petition;
3/17/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Review and respond to email regarding attorneys' fee petition and related questions;
3/17/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.90	495.00	940.50	Prepare fee petition;
3/18/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.20	495.00	594.00	Prepare fee petition;
3/21/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.20	495.00	594.00	Research and draft fee petition and supporting documents;

Harry v. McCrory  
Appendix A

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Rate	Subtotal	Description of Work
3/22/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.50	655.00	982.50	Conference with B. Stafford regarding attorneys' fee application and related issues (.9); exchange related email (.6);
3/22/2016	Stafford, William B.	3.70	495.00	1,831.50	Prepare fee petition and supporting materials;
3/23/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.90	655.00	1,244.50	Review draft motion for attorneys' fees (1.3); conference with B. Stafford regarding supporting documentation (.3); exchange related email with M. Elias (.3);
3/23/2016	Khanna, Abha	0.20	525.00	105.00	Email and confer with B. Stafford regarding fees motion (0.2);
3/23/2016	Stafford, William B.	2.40	495.00	1,188.00	Prepare fee petition and supporting documents;
3/24/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	2.50	655.00	1,637.50	Review draft motion for attorneys' fees (1.0); conference with A. Khanna and B. Stafford regarding same (1.0); exchange email with M. Elias regarding supporting declaration (.5);
3/24/2016	Khanna, Abha	2.40	525.00	1,260.00	Review and revise fee petition (1.8); confer with B. Stafford regarding same (0.2); confer with K. Hamilton and B. Stafford regarding same (0.4);
3/24/2016	Stafford, William B.	5.30	495.00	2,623.50	Research and draft fee petition and supporting documents;
3/25/2016	Khanna, Abha	0.90	525.00	472.50	Review and revise B. Stafford declaration to fee petition (0.8); email and confer with B. Stafford regarding same (0.1);
3/25/2016	Stafford, William B.	0.20	495.00	99.00	Prepare fee petition;
3/28/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Exchange email regarding fee application and supporting papers (.3); exchange email with G. Hebert regarding supporting declaration (.2);
3/28/2016	Khanna, Abha	0.20	525.00	105.00	Confer with B. Stafford regarding fee petition and next steps (0.2);
3/28/2016	Stafford, William B.	0.20	495.00	99.00	Research and draft fee petition and supporting documents;
3/29/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.00	655.00	655.00	Review fee application draft (.3); exchange email with G. Hebert regarding supporting declaration (.5); exchange related email with B. Stafford (.2);
3/29/2016	Khanna, Abha	0.10	525.00	52.50	Confer with B. Stafford regarding fee petition and narratives (0.1);
3/29/2016	Stafford, William B.	6.20	495.00	3,069.00	Research and draft fee petition and supporting documents;
3/30/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.70	655.00	458.50	Review and respond to email regarding fee application and supporting declaration;
3/30/2016	Khanna, Abha	2.40	525.00	1,260.00	Draft and revise G. Hebert declaration (1.9); confer with B. Stafford regarding same (0.2); circulate same to G. Hebert along with cover email (0.2); send email summary of fees and expenses to E. Speas for meet-and-confer purposes (0.1);
3/31/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Review and respond to email regarding draft fee application and supporting papers;

Harry v. McCrory  
Appendix A

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Rate	Subtotal	Description of Work
3/31/2016	Khanna, Abha	0.10	525.00	52.50	Email with legal team regarding fee petition and conference with opposing counsel regarding same;
3/31/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.00	495.00	495.00	Revise fee petition and supporting declaration and appendices (.9); draft correspondence to M. Elias and K. Hamilton regarding same (.1);
4/1/2016	Khanna, Abha	3.30	525.00	1,732.50	Review and revise narratives and descriptions of appendices (2.1); email and confer with B. Stafford regarding same (0.4); review and revise G. Hebert declaration (0.7); email with G. Hebert regarding same (0.1);
4/1/2016	Stafford, William B.	3.40	495.00	1,683.00	Revise fee petition and supporting declaration and appendices;
4/4/2016	Khanna, Abha	1.30	525.00	682.50	Review and revise Hebert and Speas declarations (0.3); review and revise draft fee petition (0.9); email with B. Stafford regarding same (0.1);
4/4/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.40	495.00	693.00	Finalize fee petition and accompanying declarations;
4/5/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.50	655.00	982.50	Review memoranda regarding remedial map and timelines for jurisdictional statement in Supreme Court;
4/5/2016	Khanna, Abha	0.30	525.00	157.50	Review and revise fee petition filings (0.1); email and confer with B. Stafford regarding same (0.2);
4/5/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.60	495.00	792.00	Finalize and coordinate filing of fee petition;
4/6/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	3.50	655.00	2,292.50	Review and revise draft fee petition and supporting papers (3.5);
4/10/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.80	655.00	524.00	Review and respond to email regarding request for extension of time to oppose fee petition (.8);
4/11/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Review request for extension on brief in opposition to motion for attorneys' fees and exchange related email;
4/19/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.00	655.00	655.00	Review and respond to request for extension of time to respond to application for attorneys' fees;
4/19/2016	Stafford, William B.	0.10	495.00	49.50	Review order regarding fee petition;
5/9/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.90	655.00	1,244.50	Review email from opposing counsel regarding request for extension of briefing schedule for fee application (.3); exchange related email with litigation team (1.2); follow up with M. Elias regarding same (.4);
5/9/2016	Khanna, Abha	0.10	525.00	52.50	Email with legal team regarding opposing counsel request to postpone response brief on fee petition (0.1);
5/12/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.70	655.00	458.50	Review and respond to email regarding request for extension on fee application;
5/14/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Review and respond to email regarding request for extension;

Harry v. McCrory  
Appendix A

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Rate	Subtotal	Description of Work
5/15/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Review and respond to email regarding proposed motion to stay briefing and decision on motion for an award of attorneys' fees;
5/16/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	2.10	655.00	1,375.50	Exchange email regarding proposed motion to stay consideration of application for an award of attorneys fees (.8); prepare for and telephone conference with T. Farr regarding same (.5); exchange related follow up email with litigation team (.8);
5/17/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	2.20	655.00	1,441.00	Review draft motion to stay application for attorneys' fees and related papers from T. Farr (1.4); forward draft motion and related papers and exchange email with B. Stafford regarding same (.8);
5/18/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.60	655.00	1,048.00	Forward to T. Farr proposed revisions to motion to delay application for fee award and related papers (1.2); exchange related email (.4);
6/8/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Conference with B. Stafford regarding fee application;
6/22/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Exchange email regarding fee petition and related deadlines;
6/23/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Conference with B. Stafford regarding fee petition;
6/23/2016	Khanna, Abha	0.10	525.00	52.50	Confer with B. Stafford regarding fee petition reply brief (0.1);
6/23/2016	Stafford, William B.	6.60	495.00	3,267.00	Research and draft reply in support of fee petition;
6/24/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.10	495.00	544.50	Research and draft reply in support of fee petition;
6/25/2016	Stafford, William B.	1.20	495.00	594.00	Research and draft reply in support of fee petition;
6/28/2016	Stafford, William B.	0.90	495.00	445.50	Research and draft reply brief on fee petition;
6/30/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.00	655.00	655.00	Conference with B. Stafford regarding attorney fee petition (.5); review draft fee petition (.5);
6/30/2016	Stafford, William B.	4.60	495.00	2,277.00	Research and draft reply in support of fee petition and accompanying declaration (4.6);
7/7/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.20	655.00	786.00	Review and revise draft fee application; exchange email with B. Stafford regarding same;
7/8/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	0.50	655.00	327.50	Review final fee application;
7/10/2016	Hamilton, Kevin J.	1.10	655.00	720.50	Review and revise draft reply in support of fee application (.9); exchange email with B. Stafford regarding same (.2);

**Total** **137.00** **76,919.00**